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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST

REQUEST NUMBER: 11 - 2024

REQUEST DETAILS:

Please provide the following information for your Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme for the
2022/2023 Financial Year —

1. The Name/Title/Scope of the commissioned programme in your area including programmes designed for
male victims that accept/engage/support females.

The total number of females who self-referred into the programme

The total number of self-referred females who were accepted onto the programme.

The total number of self-referred females who have completed the programme.

The total number of females referred by an agency (e.g., police, social service etc.) into the programme.
The total number of referred females who were accepted on to the programme.

The total number of referred females who have completed the programme.

The names of the organisations who have made a referral to the programme.
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Link to evaluation of programme efficacy:

9. Financial Contributors: (Inclusive of Statutory, Non-Statutory Organisations and individual voluntary
donations)
10. Budget inclusive of Running Costs

RESPONSE

The data the OPCC receive from the Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme is based on Home Office
requirements. You will note from the information below that a number of these data points were not
required and therefore not noted on record with the OPCC.

1. Suffolk Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme received £246,000 from the Home Office in
2022/23. The programme worked with Suffolk Constabulary’s Domestic Abuse Unit (1-on-1
behaviour change work) and worked with a local Suffolk charity named Iceni to help fund their Venta
Programme (predominately group session work). By supporting DA perpetrator provision, the aim
was to prevent and reduce re-offending, improve feelings of safety for victims and lasting
improvements in family life.

2. This information is not held by the OPCC, however the OPCC understands there were 3 females
referred into the programme.

3. This information is not held by the OPCC, however the OPCC understands there were 3 females
referred into the programme.

4. This information is not held by the OPCC, however the OPCC understands that the programmes have
a completion rate of approximately 75%.
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5. This information is not held by the OPCC, however the OPCC understands there were 3 females
referred into the programme.

6. This information is not held by the OPCC, however the OPCC understands there were 3 females
referred into the programme.

7. This information is not held by the OPCC, however the OPCC understands that the programmes have
a completion rate of approximately 75%.

8. This information was not required for reporting under the Home Office grant agreement. However,
the OPCC understands that the programme made onward referrals to specialist services in drug,
alcohol, mental health, debt advise, counselling and housing.

Any evaluation that has been undertaken is intellectual property of the University of Suffolk. For further
information, you will need to liaise with their relevant departments for access.

9. (Inclusive of Statutory, Non-Statutory Organisations and individual voluntary donations)
Home Office (grant agreement for £246,000, but due to underspend in the programme we were only
eligible for £242,301.79)
Match funding requirement of up to £110,000 in total from DAPU and Iceni.

10. Running costs (£20,560), Staff costs (£221,741.79) = £242,301.79
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